
LEGISLATION FOR ADOPTION OF 

THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE 

ORDINANCE NO. 532 

An ORDINANCE of the Town of Yacolt adopting the 2012 edition of the International Fuel Gas 

Code, regulating and governing fuel gas systems and gas-fired appliances in 
1

he Town of Yacolt; 

providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; repealing Ordinance No. 

454, and No. 450 of Town of Yacolt and all other ordinances or parts of laws in conflict 

therewith. 

The Town Council of the Town of Yacolt does ordain as follows: 

Section 1. . That a certain document, one (1) copy of which are on file in the office of the City 

Clerk of Town of Yacolt, being marked and designated as the International Fuel Gas Code, 2012 

edition, as published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby addpted as the Fuel 

Gas Code of the Town of Yacolt, in the State of Washington for regulating anr governing fuel 

gas systems and gas-fired appliances as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits 

and collection offees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provision/s, penalties, 

conditions and terms of said Fuel Gas Code on file in the office of the Town of Yacolt are hereby 

referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this legisla~ion, with the 

additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance. 

Section 2. The following sections are hereby revised: 

Section 101.1. Revise: 

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fuel Gas Code of Town df Yacolt, 

hereinafter referred to as "this code." 

Section 106.6.2. Revise: 

106.6.2 Fee schedule. The fees for work shall be as indicated in the following schedule. Town of 

Yacolt Fuel Gas Code Fee Schedule. 

Section 106.6.3. Revise: 

106.6.3 Fee refunds. The mayor shall authorizeor deny the refunding of fees up to 25% upon 

written request with-in 30 days of filing. 

Section 108.4. Revise: 

108.4 Violation penalties. Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to 



comply with any of lthe requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair an 

aquatic vessel in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code 

official, or of a perry it or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a 

violation punishable by a fine of not more than $1,000.00 dollars Each day that a violation 

continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. 

Section 108.5. Revise: 

108.5 Stop work or~ers. Upon notice from the code official, work on any system that is being 

done contrary to thk provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner shall 

immediately cease. Jsuch notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the 

property, or to the (j)Wner's agent, or to the person doing the work. The notice shall state the 
I 

conditions under wr ch work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the code 

official shall not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any person who 

shall continue any l ark in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work 

order, except such +ark as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe 

condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than $250.00 dollars or more than $1,000.00 

dollars. 

Section 3. That Ordinance No. 454 and Ordinance No. 440 of Town of Yacolt and also the 

lnterlocal Agreegmknt entered into under the authority of the lnterlocal Cooperation Act, 
I 

Chapter 39.34 RCWI, between Clark County, a polititcal subdivision of the State of Washington, 
I 

{"County") and the f own of Yacolt, ("Town) since 1973 for the purpose of the administration 

and enforcement of the Washington State Building Code for structures within the corporate 

limits of the Town df Yacolt and subject to the interlocal agreement provisions thereof mutually 

agree that the Cou ~ty shall no longer act as the Town of Yacolt agent in and for the 

administration and lenforcement of the Washington State Building Codes, as amended; and all 

other ordinances 01 parts of laws in conflict herewith are hereby repealed. 

Section 4. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is, for 

any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the 

remaining portions of this ordinance. The Town of Yacolt hereby declares that it would have 

passed this law, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact 

that any one or mo~e sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared 

unconstitutional. 

Section 5. That notming in this legislation or in the Building Code hereby adopted shall be 

construed to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or 

liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or 

ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this law; nor shall any just or legal right or 

remedy of any char1cter be lost, impaired or affected by this legislation. 



Section 6. That the Town of Yacolt's, City Clerk is hereby ordered and directed to cause this 

legislation to be published in a newspaper in general circulation. 

Section 7. That this law and the rules, regulations, provisions, requiremend, orders and matters 

established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect from January 28, 

2015 and after the date of its final passage and adoption. 

Section 8 - Severability. 
If any section, subsection, paragraph, sentence, clause, or phrase of this Ordinance is declared 
unconstitutional or invalid for any reason by a court of competent jurisdictid 1, the remaining 
portion of this Ordinance shall remain in full force and effect. 

Section 9 - Effective Date. 
This Ordinance shall take effect on January 28, 2015, following publication of the following 
summary, according to law. 

Town of Yacolt - Summary of Ordinance #532 

The Town Council of the Town of Yacolt adopted Ordinance #532 at its regularly 
scheduled Town Council meeting held on January 20, 2015. The contdnt of the 
Ordinance is summarized in its title as follows: 

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE 2012 
EDITION 

A copy of the full text of the Ordinance will be mailed upon request to the 
undersigned at the Town of Yacolt Town Hall, P.O. Box 160, Yacolt, WA 98675: 
(360) 686-3922. 

Published this 28th day of January, 2015. 
Cindy Marbut, Town Clerk/Treasurer 

PASSED by the Town Council of the Town of Yacolt, Washington, at a regular meeting 
thereof this 20th day of January, 2015. 

TOWN OF YACOLT 

Attest: 



Approved as to Fo 

David W. Ridenour) Town Attorney 

Ayes: 
Nays: 
Absent: 
Abstain: 


